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Writing Contractions

Write the words I am as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words I will as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words did not as one word 
using an apostrophe.

_______________________ going to the shops 

soon.

_______________________ clean the car. The car  _______________________ stop.

Write the words it is as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words we are as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words I have as one word 
using an apostrophe.

_______________________ very cold today. _______________________ all very happy. _______________________ eaten all my tea.

Write the words he has as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words do not as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words should not as one 
word using an apostrophe.

_______________________ got a lunchbox today. _______________________ play on the train 

tracks.

She  _______________________ have gone out in 

the thunderstorm.
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Writing Contractions

Write the words I am as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words I will as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words did not as one word 
using an apostrophe.

I’m going to the shops soon. I’ll clean the car. The car didn’t stop.

Write the words it is as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words we are as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words I have as one word 
using an apostrophe.

It’s very cold today. We’re all very happy. I’ve eaten all my tea.

Write the words he has as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words do not as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words should not as one 
word using an apostrophe.

He’s got a lunchbox today. Don’t play on the train tracks. She shouldn’t have gone out in the 

thunderstorm.
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Writing Contractions

Write the words it will as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words does not as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words you have as one word 
using an apostrophe.

_______________________ be fun at the fair. She  _______________________ look happy 

today.

_______________________ got long hair.

Write the words they have as one 
word using an apostrophe.

Write the words that is as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words he will as one word 
using an apostrophe.

_______________________ put too many books 

on this shelf.

_______________________ the end of the film. _______________________ let you go out to 

play.

Write the words let us as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words could not as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words we have as one word 
using an apostrophe.

_______________________ be really good at 

school.

I  _______________________ eat my dinner. _______________________ played out all day.
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Writing Contractions

Write the words it will as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words does not as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words you have as one word 
using an apostrophe.

It’ll be fun at the fair. She doesn’t look happy today. You’ve got long hair.

Write the words they have as one 
word using an apostrophe.

Write the words that is as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words he will as one word 
using an apostrophe.

They’ve put too many books on this 

shelf.

That’s the end of the film. He’ll let you go out to play.

Write the words let us as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words could not as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Write the words we have as one word 
using an apostrophe.

Let’s be really good at school. I couldn’t eat my dinner. We’ve played out all day.
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